
AMENDMENT TO THE  

SENATE AMENDMENT TO H.R.  1 

OFFERED BY MS .  HOYLE OF OREGON  

[H.R.  1,  THE ONE B IG BEAUTIFUL B ILL ACT] 

In section 50301(a)(2)(A), strike “For 

each” and insert “Subject to applicable law 

(including regulations in effect on the date of 

enactment of this Act), for each”. 

 

In section 50301(a)(3), strike 

subparagraph (C). 

 

In section 50301(b)(2)(A), strike “For 

each” and insert “Subject to applicable law 

(including regulations in effect on the date of 

enactment of this Act), for each”. 

 

In section 50301(b)(3), strike 

subparagraph (C). 

 

In section 50401(b)(2), strike 

“$171,000,000” and insert “$66,000,000”. 

 

In section 50501, strike 

“$1,000,000,000” and insert 

“$743,000,000”. 

 


